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The article analyzes the indicators that 
determine the level of production compo-
nent of economic security of Ukraine for 
the period of 2011-2014 years. According 
to official recommendations for calculating 
the level of economic security of Ukraine is 
intended for the following indicators: indus-
trial production index difference between 
Ukraine and Russia; degree of depreciation 
industry; degree of depreciation in construc-
tion; degree of depreciation of fixed assets 
at transport enterprises, warehousing, 
postal and courier activities; degree of fixed 
assets depreciation in agriculture, hunting, 
forestry; share of high-tech products in the 
total volume of industrial products; com-
plexity of industrial production; operating 
profitability of industrial enterprises; operat-
ing profitability of enterprises building; oper-
ating profitability of enterprises of transport, 
warehousing, postal and courier activities; 
volume of construction works to 1990; fixed 
yield of grain and leguminous crops; aver-
age annual milk yield per cow; ratio of import 

prices in Ukraine and Europe. As additional 
indicators are calculated the following indi-
cators: gross value added of industry of 
Ukraine at constant prices of 2010; value 
added industry of Ukraine at current prices; 
Index of industrial production in Ukraine; vol-
ume of construction works; Indices of con-
struction products. Based on the analysis it 
is found that the dynamics of the analyzed 
indicators shows the deteriorating level of 
industrial safety, which in turn has a nega-
tive impact on economic security. Revealed 
that a major factor in long-term action that 
prevents the growth of industrial compo-
nent of economic security serves ultra-high 
depreciation of fixed assets, which not only 
adversely affects the production capacity 
of domestic enterprises, but also leads to 
an increase in technical and technologi-
cal backwardness of our country from the 
developed world countries proves a small 
proportion of the development of high-tech 
products in the total volume of industrial 
products.


